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PARFÜMERIE PRECIOSA 1871 

Total Body Wash 
 
 
REF 672408 
 
Product Description and  
Purpose 
The wet, hand-shaped washing gloves are 
used for the professional whole-body 
washing especially of lying patients. The 
washing gloves replace water, soap and 
towel. They are pH skin neutral, with Aloe, 
and therefore gentle to the skin. By 
systematic use of exactly 8 gloves for the 
different areas of the body, cross-
contamination from one area to another 
can be prevented. The washing gloves 
can be heated in in their package in the 
microwave at 700 watts for 40 seconds.  
 
Composition 
Spunlace, aqua, glycerine, Aloe 
barbadensis leaf extract, cocamidopropyl 
betaine, phenoxyethanol, 
ethylhexylglycerine, benzoic acid, 
dehydroacetic acid, perfume, citric acid 
                                       
Normative and Legal  
Requirements 
Total Body Wash  is subject to the 
regulation on cosmetic products (dated 
July 16, 2014, amended by Article 2 of the 
regulation of 26 January, 2016) and the 
EU-Regulation (EC) 1223/2009. 
 
The product does not contain dangerous 
toxic substances according to REACH. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Packaging 
Primary packaging:      resealable foil  

bag (PET/PE) 
 
Secondary packaging:  carton made of  
 cellulose    
 
 
Storage  
To be stored in a dust-free environment, 
protected against direct sunlight. 
 
 
 
The product bears following labels and 
symbols 
 
 

                     
 
 
 
 

1871 PARFÜMERIE PRECIOSA® 

     
is a brand of  PRECIOSA 1871 Dr. Danz GmbH 

www.preciosa1871.com 
 


